NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION

2020-A-001 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS AUTO PARTS

VENDOR RATE Special ltem Rates
Best wholesale or Fleet
price, whichever is
B & G Auto Parts cheaper on all parts.

Corsicana Napa Auto Parts

Wholesale or better

Mills Auto Supply

Dealer Price

{'Reilly Auto Parts

List Less 41% or Better

All Bids Awarded

2020 BID TAB
AUTO PARTS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2020-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR; Wilson Culverts
DIAMETER (Inches) | Gage
CULVERTS (price per linear foot)

12 16 $ 8.34 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 $ 10.42 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 $ 12.46 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 16.58 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 $ 20.77 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 25.13 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 29.04 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 $ 47.64 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
60 14 $ 58.69 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
72 14 $ 70.95 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
96 14 $ 93.57 | 3" x 1" Corrugation

DELIVERY 7-10 Working Days

DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $ 12.51
15" $ 15.63
18" $ 18.69
24" $ 24.87
30" $ 31.15
36" $ 37.69
42" $ 43.56
48" $ 49.74
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE

12" 2-12" 1§ 113.58 | Pair w/bands
15" 2-15" | § 176.99 | Pair w/bands
18" 2-18" | § 245.56 | Pair w/bands
24" 2-24" | § 379.44 | Pair w/bands
30" 2-30"1% 545.09 | Pair w/bands
36" 2-36"1% 757.18 | Pair w/bands

DELIVERY 7 - 10 Working Days

CONTACT NAME Greg Barnett Manager
CONTACT PHONE 800-234-0084 903-764-5605 wilsonculverts @ hotmail com

Contract awarded to:

All Bids Awarded

2020 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2020-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

Steele Metal
VENDOR: Supply, Inc
DIAMETER (Inches) Gage
CULVERTS (price per linear foot)

12 16 $ 10.65 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 $ 13.30 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 $ 15.90 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 21.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 $ 26.50 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 32.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 37.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 $ 60.00 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
60 14 $ 74.00 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
72 14 $ 90.00 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
96 14 $ 118.00 | 3" x 1" Corrugation

e i

DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $ 15.80
15" $ 19.70
18" $ 25.00
24" $ 31.40
30" $ 39.30
36" $ 47.50
42" $ 55.00
48" $ 75.50
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE

12" $ 163.20
15" $ 248.00
18" 5 352.65
24" $ 532.90
30" $ 758.20
36" $ 1,044.15

DELIVERY ey

CONTACT NAME Wendy Steele Owner
CONTACT PHONE 903-519-3563 steelemetalsupply @ outlook.com

2020 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2020-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR:
DIAMETER {Inches}

Gage

ADS, Inc

HP STORM - POLYPROPYLENE PIPE (price per linear foot)

12 16 3 6.65
15 16 $ 9.05
18 16 $ 11.95
24 16 $ 16.13
30 16 $ 28.32
36 16 $ 32.62
42 16 $ 40.21
48 14 $ 50.34
60 14 $ 78.10
72 14 $ - NQO BID
96 14 $ . NO BID
DELIVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS
PREMIUM SPLIT COUPLERS (price each)
12" $ 6.65
15" $ 9.05
18" $ 11.95
24" $ 16.13
30" $ 28.32
36" $ 32.62
42" $ 80.42
48" $ 100.68
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE
12" $ - NO BID
15" $ . NO BID
18" $ - NO BID
24" $ . NO BID
30" $ = NO BID
36" $ . NO BID
DELIVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS
CONTACT NAME Jason Hannan Sales Rep - North, TX
CONTACT PHONE 214-724-9729 iason hannan @ads-pipe.com

2020 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS

BID TABULATION

2020-F-004 - ANNUAL CONTRACT

FUEL FOR COUNTY VEHICLES
L2 1o lor Winters Oil Johnson Oil
UNLEADED
Grade 87 Octane 87 Octane 89 Octane
Rack Price 1.6788 1.6863
Tax 0.2000 0.2000
Freight 0.0450 -
Profit 0.0350 0.0700
Total Cost 1.9588 1.9563
Primary Distributor Flint Hills Flint Hills
Winters Qil Johnson Qil
DIESEL
Rack Price 1.8780 1.9160
Tax 0.2000 0.2000
Freight 0.0500 .
Profit 0.0400 0.0700
Total Cost 2.1680 2.1860
LRIy Flint Hills Flint Hills
CONTACT NAME Jody Judson Michelle Boyd
CONTACT PHONE 903-872-4166 903-872-6621

Bid awarded to:

2020 BID TAB
FUEL

Unleaded Gas: Johnson Oil

Diesel: Winters Qil




Navarro

County, Texas

Bid Tabulation
2020-H-001 - Annual Contract for Hauling

montiemontion @ hotmail.com

Vendor #of |Dellvery| Delivery Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Chg per Ten Additional
Company Name Trucks | Time | Limitations | per Ton/Truck Pct i1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 or Ton-Mile Comments
BM Logistics Blum $13.90 Blum $13 48 Blum $9.80 Blum $9.89 .
508 N Kerr e Mexia $9.20 Mexia $8 30 Mexia $7.90 Mexia $8.70 S hacindE
Blooming Grove, TX 76626 Unlimited Open None Unlimited : Marlin Marietta Martin Marietta Mariin Marietta Martin Marietta Per Ton ) Pe
Martin Marietta $4.89 out of Precincis
Ben Malion MS)-Waco §13 00 $5.50 $4.00 $6.70 $5.74 Bams
903-875-9228 MSI-Waco $15.00 | MSi-Waco $14.05 | MSI-Waco $10.05 | MSI-Waco $13.00
Conners-Reagan | Conners-Reagan | Conners-Reagan | Conners-Reagan
$16.00 $12.00 $13.25 $19.00
Conners-Reagan | Helcamp-Groasbeck Helcamp- Helcamp- Helcamp-
$15.00 $11.25 Groasbeck $9.50 | Groesbeck $10.50 | Groesbeck $10.75
Helcamp-Groesbeck K River/Skyhigh K River/Skyhigh K River/Skyhigh K RiverSkyhigh
$10.75 §11.25 $9.50 $10.00 $11.00
Coker & Son Trucking K River/Skyhigh $11.00]  Martin Marietta Mariin Marietta Martin Marigtta Martin Marietia
404 An CR 2123 Mariin Marietta $7.75 $8 50 $7.75 $9.50 $9.00 Hourly Rate is
Palestine, TX 75803 5 Open None Minimum 24 / Trinity-Streetman Trinity-Streelman | Trinity-Streetman | Trinity-Streelman | Trinily-Streeiman Per Ton $100.00 per hour
Timothy Coker, Owner - Maximum 28 $10.00 $12.00 $5.50 $12.00 $12.00 with a (4) hour
903-391-7024 Texas Bit-Malakoft Texas Bit-Malakoff | Texas Bit-Malakoff | Texas Bit-Malakoff [ Texas Bit-Malakof minimum.
coker480@gmail.com $12,00 $9.00 $12.00 $14.00 $13.00
Texas Bit-Corsicana | Texas Bil-Corsicana Texas Bit- Texas Bit- Texas Bit-
$5.00 $8.00 Corsicana §7.75 | Corsicana $10.00 | Corsicana $9.00
Waco Central $12 50 Waco Central Waco Ceniral Waco Centra! Waca Central
Waco Mine Svc $14.00 $15.00 $12.50 $10.00 $12.50
Waco Mine Sve Waco Mine Svc Waco Mine Sve Waco Ming Svc
$17.00 $14.00 $11.00 $14.75
Havoc Transpartation Blum $13.85 Blum $13.49 Blum $9.85 Blum $9.75
Dernalition, LLC Blum $11.89 c ; Conner-Mexia | Conner-Mexia | Conner-Mexia
. . onner-Mexia
PO Box 57 Minimum 12 nozzmq.z_mx_m $9.10 $9.95 .am.mo .m.\,.mo. mm.mo.
Blooming Grove, TX Unlimited [Anytime None Maximum 28 Martin Marietta Martin Marietta Martin Marietta | Martin Marsielta | Martin Maristta Per Ton
76626 $4.90 $5.50 $4.00 $6.65 $5.70
Jason Drain MSI-Waco $13.00 z_m_-<<nmo $15.00 MSI-Waco MSt-Waco MSI-Waco
903-654-3337 ) ) $14.00 $10.00 $12.84
Blum $13.80 Blum $10.07 Blum $10.03
Mexia $8.50 Mexia $8.37 Mexia $8.71
Martin Marietta | Martin Marietta | Marlin Marietta No weekend
M Karmy Services Anytime Minimum 22 _,_w”“ﬁ_mmw_dwww :ﬂ”hxﬁmm._...wnwam 87.25 $8.10 $8.74 hauling, from
3413 FM 2280 Unlimited |Anytime | Monday thru Maximum 27 Martin z_mn.mzm Martin _sma.mzm Waco Sve Waco Svc Waco Svc Friday sundown
Clebumne, TX 76031 Friday §7.95 $7.95 $14.25 $10.30 $14.15 to Sunday
Michell Karmy, Owner . ’ Conners- Conners- Conners- sundown.
817-713-3709 Greenwald Plant | Greenwald Plant | Greenwald Plant
mkarmy75 @gmail.com $13.75 $10.20 $10.20
z__o__zm:n._w:nxw_.% 4 Minimum 13 gm:ﬁ.\_,mwzmzm 1 Day advance
325 SE CR 30 ; . .
Corsicans, TX 75108 Maximum 23 Mexia $11.25 notice.
903-654-8518

2020 Bid Tab
Hauling




Navarro County, Texas
Bid Tabulation
2020-H-001 - Annual Contract lor Hauling

Nitty Gritty Delivery
PC Box 591/ 810 FM 3043

254-578-1753

Blum. TX 7662 Blum $13.00 Blum $14.00 Blum $16.50 Blum $10.25 Blum $10.50
_u”.__:. Mekinn i Unlimited | Open None Minimum 22 Mexia $10.50 Mexia $10.50 Mexia $8.00 Mexia $9.00 Meanxia $9.00 Per Ton
Os.::M:o o m_m_mw.. P Maximum 25 Martin Marietta Martin Marietta | Martin Marigtta | Martin Marietta | Martin Marietta
817-933.8162 $7.25 $7.50 £7.50 $8.50 $8.50 tmmmo.n_u per load

. from bam to
danny @m-maollfielt.com project site.

Blum $13.50 Blum $9.89 Blum $9.85
$125.00 per logd 1
Mexia $8.25 | Mexia$8.25 | Mexia$8.50 Bampropct st
T Bar D Trucking Blum $12.50 Blum $16.00 Martin Maristia | Martin Marietta | Marlin Marietta Hourly Truck work is
, R . $7.00 $8.00 $8.50 $80.00 hr within 20
T Unlimited | Anytime |  None Lol e UL T ezt ALY Waco Svc Waco Sve Waco Svc Per Ton  [Mieradius4hr
Whitney, TX 76692 Maximum 27 Martin Marietta Martin Marietta $14.00 $10.10 $13.85 minimum. Any other
254-396-7205 $7.00 $7.00 ) 4 ) hauling that isn'l
Conners- Conners- Conners- covered by (his rate
Greenwald Plant | Greenwald Plant | Greenwald Plant sheet will be figured al
$13.50 $10.00 $10.00 .20 cent per ton mile
loaded.
Mo__m__h_,wmﬂ,\_o:aoame e Blum $12.45 Blum $1575 | BumS$1550 | Blum$10.60 | Blum $9.68 $200.00/10ad
- Minimum 13 Mexia $8.52 Mexia $10.75 Mexia §7.75 Mexia $9.00 Mexia $9.00 :
_.uwo%o__u_g._.mnm uqmmum Unlimited | Gpen e Maximum 25 Martin Marietta Martin Marietta | Martin Marietta | Martin Marietta | Martin Mariatta ) n”u.mww %:_mo
. $7.50 $8.25 $7.75 $8.50 $8.75

Awarded to the lowest Bid per |location of pit at the discretion of the County Commissioners Precincts.

2020 Bid Tab
Hauling




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS

BID NO.
2020-R-004 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION
Waste
FLEXIBLE TYPE "C" Crushed (Scrap D/F BLEND | OTHER
HOT HOT MIX BASE FLEXIBLE| FLEX a*.5" Concrete Asphalt) TYPE “C* TYPE "D" ABTO 1/2 {Ses
oL COLD | CATIONIC | LIMESTONE BASE BASE C-Rack 34 SCREENED | 247 Flex Crushed LIMESTONE |LIMESTONE| DIRTY PEA CRUSHED Notes
{Material picked up at pitiplant) VENDOR LOCATION SAND | HOT MIX LAID |EMULSION| TYPE Af1/2 ANj2 Al22 | Crushed Gravel ROCK Base D/M/2 Asphalt ROCK ROCK ROCK |GRAVEL| GRAVEL Below)
Amnold Crushed Stone (NO BID FOR FY 2020) Blum
8ig City Crushed Concrete Dallas 9.00 9.00 I,
Claveland Asphalt Shephard 464.10
Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck 7.75 7.75
Emgon Asphalt Temple 487.90 Il
| Havoc Transportation Waco 6.50 7.00 14.00 9.00 n.
Helcamp Materals, LTD Groesbeck 8.00 8.00 V.
Knife River (NO BID FOR FY2020) Groesbeck
Martin Marietta Corsicana 18.00 17.00 26.00 26.00 ] 22.00
| Mine Servica Waco 6.25 6.25 12.50 8.00 11.50 V.
Rattler Rock Blum 6.00 7.00 Vi,
Sustainable Pavement Technoligies Dallas/Richland Hills 18.00 VIiI.
Texas Bit Corsicana/Malakoft §4.00 76.00 78.00
WASTE Waste
FLEXIBLE CRUSHED Crushad {Serap D/F BLEND
HOT HOT MIX BASE FLEXIBLE| FLEX CONCRETE Flexible Concrata Asphalt) TYPE “C" TYPE "D" 38TO 112
on COLD | CATIONIC | LIMESTONE BASE BASE FLEXBASE Base Type | 247 Flex Crushed LIMESTONE |LIMESTONE| DIRTY PEA CRUSHED
PCT1 SAND | HOT MIX LAID |EMULSION] TYPE Afl/2 A2 D/1/2 TYPE Df/2 Af2f2 Baae D/t/2 Asphait ROCK ROCK ROCK |GRAVEL| GRAVEL OTHER
Amold Crushed Stone (NQ BID FOR FY 2020) Blum
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas 29.00 29.00 l.
Claveland Asphalt Shephard 50232
| Conners Crushed Sione Groesbeck
Ergon Asphalt Temple 524.90 Il
Havoc Transportation Blooming Grove .
Helcamp Materials, LTD Groesbeck V.
Knife River Waco
Martin Marietta Corsicana 22.25 21.25 30.25 3025 | 26.25
| Mine Service Waco V.
Rattler Rock Blum _ V.
Sustainable Pavement Technoligies Dalias/Richland Hills 29.15 VII.
Texas Bit Corsicana
WASTE Waste
FLEXIBLE CRUSHED Crushad {Scrap D/F BLEND
HOT HOT MIX BASE FLEXIBLE| FLEX CONCRETE Flexible Concrete Asphalt) TYPE “C" TYPE "D" 48 TO 172
OIL COLD | CATIONIC | LIMESTONE BASE BASE FLEXBASE Base Type | 247 Flex Crushed LIMESTONE |LIMESTONE| DIRTY PEA CRUSHED
PCT 2 SAND | HOT MIX LAID |EMULSION| TYPE Afl/2 A2 D/1/2 TYPE D/M/2 Af2f2 Base D//2 Asphalt ROCK ROCK ROCK |GRAVEL| GRAVEL OTHER
Armold Crushed Stone (NO BID FOR FY 2020) Blum
 Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas 31.50 31.50 ]
Claveland Asphalt Shephard 500,32
| Conners Crushed Stone Grogsbeck
Ergon Asphalt Temple 524.90 1l.
Havoc Transportation Blooming Grove .
Helcamp Materials, LTD Groesbeck V.
Knile River Waco
Martin Marietta Corsicana 23.00 22.00 31.00 31.00| 27.00
| Mine Service Waco V.
Rattler Rock Blum _ V.
Sustainable Pavement Technoligies Dallas/Richland Hills 29.15 VIL.
Texas Bit Malakoff

2020 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS

BID NO.
2020-R-004 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS
BID TABULATION
WASTE Waste
FLEXIBLE CRUSHED Crushed {Scrap D/F BLEND
HOT HOT MIX BASE FLEXIBLE| FLEX CONCRETE Flexible Concreta Asphalt} TYPE "C* TYPE "D* A8 TO 1/2
OIL COLD | CATIONIC | LIMESTONE BASE BASE FLEXBASE Base Typs | 247 Flax Crushed LIMESTONE |LIMESTONE| DIRTY PEA CRUSHED
PCT3 _ SAND | HOT MIX LAID |EMULSION| TYPE ANf2 A2 Dif2 TYPE D/12 Al2i2 Base D/1/2 Asphalt ROCK ROCK ROCK |GRAVEL| GRAVEL OTHER
Amold Crushed Stone (NO BID FOR FY 2020) Blum
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas 31.50 31.50 I
Cleveland Asphalt Shephard 508.32
Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck
Ergon Asphalt Temple §24.90 Il
Havoc Transporation Blooming Grove I,
Helcamp Materials, LTD Groesbeck IV,
Knile River Waco
Martin Maristia Corsicana 24.00 2300 32.00 3200| 2625
Mine Service Waco V.
Rattler Rock Blum VI.
 Sustainable Pavement Technoligies Dallas/Richland Hills 29.15 Vil
Texas Bit Corsicana
WASTE Waste
FLEXIBLE CRUSHED Crushed (Scrap D/F BLEND
HOT HOT MIX BASE FLEXIBLE| FLEX CONCRETE Flexible Concrete Asphalt) TYPE “C* TYPE “D" ¥8TO 12
OIL COLD | CATIONIC | LIMESTONE BASE BASE FLEXBASE Base Type | 247 Flex Crushed LIMESTONE |LIMESTONE| DIRTY PEA CRUSHED
PCT 4 SAND | HOT MIX LAID |EMULSION| TYPE Afi/2 A2 DH/2 TYPE D172 AS22 Base D/1f2 Asphalt ROCK ROCK ROCK |GRAVEL| GRAVEL OTHER
Amold Crushed Stone (NO BID FOR FY 2020) Blum
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas 29.00 29.00 I,
Cleveland Asphalt Shephard 509 32
Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck
Ergon Asphalt Temple 524.90 1.
Havoc Transperation Blooming Grove 118
Helcamp Materials, LTD Groesbeck \'A
Knile River Temple
Martin Maristta Corsicana 23.50 22.50 31.50 31.50 | 27.50
Mine Service Waco V.
Rattler Rock Blum 29.15 VI
Sustainable Pavemant Technoligies Datlas/Richland Hills
Texas Bit Malakoff

Other Products offered are on last page.

Prices shown ara per ton unless otherwise specified.

t. Big City Crushed Concrete
PO Box 20818

Dallas, TX 75229

Randy Harding

972-243-5820

in place of Limestone Flax Base we are pricing Flex Basa Typs D Grads 1-2 item 247 TXDOT.
Material + delivery fes

Precinet 1 - $29.00

Precinct 2 - $31.50

Precinct 3 (Dawson) - $31.50

Precinet 3 (Richland) - $31.50

Precint 4 - $28.00

Il. Ergon Asphalt

11612 AM 2244, Bidg 1, 5ts 250

Austin, TX 78736

.M. McKemis, Regional Marketing Mar.
512-468-9292 PH

512-468-0391 FX

This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 Gallons. Freight is based on a full transpon foad, even it a full load of material
is not ortered. The common carrier bills demurrage at § B3.00 per hour, after the second hour. Ralurn fraight
is ong-half of the outgoing tariff. Pump and Hose charge is $90.00 per load.

2020 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID NO.

2020-R-004 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ROAD AND BASE MATERIALS

BID TABULATION

. Havoe Transportation

1* - 3" gversized limestone $10.50 ton

PO Box 57 3 % 5 aversized limestone $10.50
Blooming Grove, TX 76626 Concrets Sand 55.50

 tason Drain 4 C Rock $12.00

003-257-5385

V. Helmcamp Matarials, LTD 1" x 3* Limaslone - $ 18.00/Ton

PO Box 456

Buftalo, TX 75831

James Carlisle, Area Manager
978-219-4270

3" x 5* Limastong - $ 16.00/Ton
6" x 12" Limestone - $27.00/Ton
12° x 1B® Limestona - $27.00/Ton
18" + Limasiona - $30.00/Ton

V. Mine Services Inc
PO Bax 32
RAockdale, TX 76567

ﬁm_..u__ Campball, Project Manager
512-446-7011 PH
512-446-7108 FX

Flexible Base - Limastone / Non-tested Flex Base §6.25/Ton

Flexit'a Base - Non-Tasted Flex Base $6.25/Ton

“C" Rock 3/4° Crushed Graval Non-tasted $12.50/Ton

D/F Bland 28”10 1/2° Crushed Gravel 511.50/Ton

Tarpedo Rock could ba used for Pipe Badding - $4.75/Ton (Matarial Only)}

VI. Rattler Rock, Inc

PO Box 10

Blum, TX 76627

Charles L. Davis, Il - Presidant
254-874-5282

rattlerrock & yahog.com

1" - 3“ Screened rock $7.00/Ton
Untastad Blue Basa $5.00/ton

Vil. Sustainable Pavemant Technologies, LLC
21175 Tomball Pkwy, #267

Houston, TX 77070

Andy Pujats, Vice President
972-342-1870

andy @ sptpavement.com

Racycted Asphalt Shingles (RAS) Material is processed by Sustainable Pavement Technologies
and sized such thal 100% passes 3/8" sieva. RAS usad in county road applications is primardy
used as dust control and aggregate praservation (o exisling or new rcads. RAS s also used as
an additive to oil sand.

Price $18.00/Ton FOB SPT Dallas or FI Worth locations.

Price Delivered to all Pracincts is $ 29.15

SPT Dallas: 11143 Goodnight Lo - Dallas, TX 75229
SPT Ft Wonh. 2301 Austin Rd - Richland Hills, TX 76118

All Bids Awarded.

2020 BID TABS




